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The Secretary Of State for Transport hereby gives notice that he has confirmed with 
modifications the above Scheme which was made by Lancashire County Council 
under section 106(3) of the Highways Act 1980 and which, as confirmed, authorises 
the Council to construct over the navigable waters of the Savick Brook (Millenium 
Ribble Link) the bridge specified in the Schedule to this Scheme as part of the 
highway which they are proposing to construct between the M55 Motorway at 
Junction 2 and the highway known as A583 Riversway, Preston, Lancashire in the 
District of Preston in the said County.   
 

Copies of the Scheme (as confirmed) and of the relevant plans and specifications 
may be inspected free of charge at all reasonable hours at the offices of Lancashire 
County Council, Environment Directorate, Pitt Street, Preston PR1 0LD, Preston City 
Council, Town Hall, Preston PR1 2RL, Fylde Borough Council, Town Hall, Lytham St 
Anne’s FY8 1LW, Ingol Library, Ventnor Place, Ingol, Preston PR2 3YX and Savick 
Library, 6 Birkdale Drive, Ashton-on-Ribble, Preston PR2 1UL. 
 
Copies of the instrument of confirmation of the Scheme, SI No XXXX, which is 
entitled “The Lancashire County Council (Savick Brook Viaduct) Scheme 2018 
Confirmation Instrument 2019” and which contains a copy of the relevant Scheme as 
confirmed, can be obtained at www.legislation.gov.uk or purchased either through 
booksellers or direct from Government bookshops (The Stationery Office 
(https://tsoshop.co.uk)). 
 
Any person aggrieved by the Scheme and desiring to question the validity thereof, or 
of any provision contained therein, on the ground that it is not within the powers of 
the Highways Act 1980 or on the ground that any requirement of that Act, or of any 
regulations made thereunder, has not been complied with in relation to the Scheme, 
may, within 6 weeks from 30 April 2019 apply to the High Court for the suspension or 
quashing of the Scheme or of any provision contained therein. 
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